



PRICE AGREEMENT NO. 14866

AMENDMENT NO.

ALBUQUERQUE PUBLIC SCHOOLS - PROCUREMENT DIVISION  
PO BOX 25704  
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO 87126  
PHONE (505) 881-8415  
FAX (505) 830-1161

V  
E  
N  
D  
O  
R

Junior Library Guild  
7858 Industrial Pkwy  
Plain City, OH 43064

SHIP TO

Please see PO  
Please see PO

ATTENTION  
OF

DATE	VENDOR CODE
8/28/2017	11341

The Procurement Code, Sections 13-1-28 through 13-1-199 NMSA 1978, imposes civil and criminal penalties for its violation. In addition, the New Mexico Criminal statutes impose felony penalties for illegal bribes, gratuities and kickbacks.

PLEASE SHOW PRICE AGREEMENT NUMBER ON ALL INVOICES, SHIPPING PAPERS, PACKAGES, CORRESPONDENCE, ETC. INVOICE IN DUPLICATE.

ITEMS, TERMS, & CONDITIONS

PRICE AGREEMENT

Books

Contract Term: August 28, 2017 - August 27, 2021

Per terms and conditions of: BID 18-003KN

Board Approved: 8/28/2017

Pricing Attached

**SERVICES AND/OR GOODS TO BE PROVIDED:** The Contractor shall provide the good(s) and/or service(s), as defined in this agreement, on an "as ordered" basis. This is not an order and no funds are obligated under this Pricing Agreement. Funds are obligated by approved purchase orders on an "as needed" basis. Contractor shall receive separate individual Purchase Orders for each individual requests.

**MINIMUM AMOUNT:** Albuquerque Public Schools does not guarantee a minimum amount of purchases in conjunction with this pricing agreement.

**QUOTES AND PAYMENT:** The Contractor shall include the APS Pricing Agreement Number on each quote and reflect the price as awarded. If a quote is based on a percentage discount, the quote should document the list price, discount percent, and final price. The invoice submitted for payment shall match the quote and shall note the purchase order number.

**Amendments:** This Pricing Agreement shall not be altered, changed, or amended except by written agreement signed by both parties.

**Reason for Amendment:**

Contact: Barb Sanders

Phone: 800/491-0174

Email: sales@juniorlibraryguild.com

PROCUREMENT DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Crystal Nicole Marquez 8/29/17  
Date

VENDOR AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

Angela Contreras 8/31/17  
Date



ALBUQUERQUE PUBLIC SCHOOLS - PROCUREMENT DIVISION  
PO BOX 25704  
ALBUQUERQUE, NEW MEXICO 87125  
PHONE (505) 881-8415  
FAX (505) 830-1161

V  
E  
N  
D  
O  
R

Junior Library Guild  
7858 Industrial Pkwy  
Plain City, OH 43064

SHIP TO

Please see PO  
Please see PO

ATTENTION  
OF

DATE	VENDOR CODE
8/28/2017	11341

The Procurement Code, Sections 13-1-28 through 13-1-199 NMSA 1978, imposes civil and criminal penalties for its violation. In addition, the New Mexico Criminal statutes impose felony penalties for illegal bribes, gratuities and kickbacks.

PLEASE SHOW PRICE AGREEMENT NUMBER ON ALL INVOICES, SHIPPING PAPERS, PACKAGES, CORRESPONDENCE, ETC. INVOICE IN DUPLICATE.

ITEMS, TERMS, & CONDITIONS

PRICE AGREEMENT

Books

Contract Term: August 28, 2017 - August 27, 2021

Per terms and conditions of: BID 17-003KN

Board Approved: 8/28/2017

Pricing Attached

**SERVICES AND/OR GOODS TO BE PROVIDED:** The Contractor shall provide the good(s) and/or service(s), as defined in this agreement, on an "as ordered" basis. This is not an order and no funds are obligated under this Pricing Agreement. Funds are obligated by approved purchase orders on an "as needed" basis. Contractor shall receive separate individual Purchase Orders for each individual requests.

**MINIMUM AMOUNT:** Albuquerque Public Schools does not guarantee a minimum amount of purchases in conjunction with this pricing agreement.

**QUOTES AND PAYMENT:** The Contractor shall include the APS Pricing Agreement Number on each quote and reflect the price as awarded. If a quote is based on a percentage discount, the quote should document the list price, discount percent, and final price. The invoice submitted for payment shall match the quote and shall note the purchase order number.

**Amendments:** This Pricing Agreement shall not be altered, changed, or amended except by written agreement signed by both parties.

**Reason for Amendment:**

Contact: Barb Sanders

Phone: 800/491-0174

Email: sales@juniorlibraryguild.com

PROCUREMENT DIVISION AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

*Krystal Nicole Marquez* 8/29/17  
Date

VENDOR AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

\_\_\_\_\_  
Date

**ALBUQUERQUE PUBLIC SCHOOLS (APS)  
GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS**

- 1. INSPECTION.** The materials, supplies or services furnished shall be exactly as specified in this order, free from defects in Seller's design, workmanship and materials, and, except as otherwise provided in this order, shall be subject to inspection and test by APS at all times and places. If, prior to final acceptance, any materials, supplies or services are found to be defective or not as specified, APS may reject them, require Seller to correct them without charge, or require delivery of such materials, supplies, or services at a reduction in price which is equitable under the circumstances. If Seller is unable or refuses to correct such defects within a time deemed reasonable by APS, APS may terminate the order in whole or in part. Seller shall bear all risks as to rejected materials, supplies and services and, in addition to any other costs for which Seller may become liable to APS under other provisions of this order, shall reimburse APS for all transportation costs, other related costs incurred, or payments to Seller in accordance with the terms of this order for unaccepted materials, supplies and services. Notwithstanding final acceptance and payment, Seller shall be liable for latent defects, fraud or such gross mistakes as amount to fraud. Any test programs and procedures required by the specifications are in addition to, and do not limit, APS's rights provided in this Paragraph.
- 2. WARRANTIES.** Seller warrants the materials, supplies or services furnished to be exactly as specified in this order, free from defects in Seller's design, labor, materials and manufacture, and to be in compliance with any drawings or specifications incorporated herein and with any samples furnished by Seller. All applicable UCC warranties, express or implied are incorporated herein.
- 3. ASSIGNMENT.** Neither the order nor any interest therein, nor claim thereunder shall be assigned or transferred by the Seller except as authorized in writing by APS. No assignment or transfer shall relieve the Seller from its obligations and liabilities.
- 4. CHANGES.** APS may make changes within the general scope of this order by giving notice to Seller and subsequently confirming such changes in writing. If such changes affect the cost of, or the time required for performance of this order, an appropriate equitable adjustment shall be made. No change by Seller shall be recognized without written approval of APS. Any claim of Seller for an adjustment under this Paragraph must be made in writing within thirty (30) days from the date of receipt by Seller of notification of such change unless APS waives this condition. Nothing in this Paragraph shall excuse Seller from proceeding with performance of the order as changed hereunder.
- 5. LABOR DISPUTES.** Seller shall give prompt notice to APS of any actual or potential labor dispute which delays or may delay timely performance of this order.
- 6. TERMINATION AND DELAYS.** APS may by written notice stating the extent and effective date, terminate this order for convenience in whole or in part, at any time. APS shall pay Seller as full compensation for performance until such termination: (1) the unit or pro rata order price for the delivered and accepted portion; and (2) a reasonable amount, not otherwise recoverable from other sources by Seller as approved by APS with respect to the undelivered or unaccepted portion of this order; provided compensation hereunder shall in no event exceed the total order price. Such amount will be limited to the Seller's actual cost and shall not include anticipated profits.

APS may by written notice terminate this order for Seller's default, in whole or in part, at any time, if Seller refuses or fails to comply with the provisions of this order, or so fails to make progress as to endanger performance and does not cure such failure within a reasonable period of time, or fails to make deliveries of the items or services or to perform the services within the time specified or any written extension thereof. In such event, APS may purchase or otherwise secure items or services and, except as otherwise provided herein, Seller shall be liable to APS for any excess costs occasioned APS thereby, including incidental and consequential damages.

If, after notice of termination for default, APS determines that the Seller was not in default or that the failure to perform this order is due to causes beyond the control and without the fault or negligence of Seller (including, but not restricted to, acts of God or of the public enemy, acts of APS, acts of Government, fires, floods, epidemics, quarantine restrictions, strikes, freight embargoes, unusually severe weather, and delays of a subcontractor or supplier due to such causes and without the fault or negligence of the subcontractor or supplier), termination shall be deemed for the convenience of APS, unless it shall be determined that the items or services covered by this order were obtainable from other sources in sufficient time to meet the required delivery schedule.

If APS determines that Seller has been delayed in the work due to causes beyond the control and without the fault and negligence of the Seller, APS may extend the time for completion of the work called for by this order, when promptly applied for in writing by the Seller; and if such delay is due to failure of APS, not caused or contributed by Seller, to perform services or deliver property in accordance with the terms of the order, the time and price of the order shall be subject to change under the Changes Paragraph. Sole remedy of Seller in event of delay by failure of APS to perform shall, however, be limited to any money actually and necessarily expended in the work during the period of delay, solely by reason of delay. No allowance will be made for anticipated profits.

The rights and remedies of APS provided in this Paragraph shall not be exclusive and are in addition to any other rights and remedies provided by law or under this order. As used in this Paragraph, the word "Seller" includes Seller and its sub suppliers at any tier.
- 7. AFFIRMATIVE ACTION.** Seller shall not maintain or provide racially segregated facilities for employees at any establishment under his control. Seller agrees to adhere to the principle set forth in Executive Order 11246 and 11375, and to undertake specifically to maintain employment policies and practices that affirmatively promote equality of opportunity for minority group persons and women; to take affirmative steps to hire and promote women and minority group persons at all job levels and in all aspects of employment; to communicate this policy effectively to all persons concerned within Seller's company, with outside recruiting services and the minority community at large; to provide APS on request a breakdown of its labor force by ethnic group, sex, and job category; and to discuss with APS its policies and practices relating to its affirmative action program.
- 8. INDEMNIFICATION AND INSURANCE.** Seller assumes the entire responsibility and liability for losses, expenses, damages, demands and claims in connection with or arising out of any actual or alleged personal injury (including death) and/or damage or destruction to property sustained or alleged to have been sustained in connection with or arising out of the performances of the work by Seller, its agents, employees, subcontractors or consultants, except to the extent of liability arising out of the negligent performance of the work by or willful misconduct of APS. Seller shall indemnify and hold harmless APS, its officers, agents, and employees from any and all liability for such losses, expenses, damages, demands, and claims and shall defend any suit or action brought against any or all of them based on any actual or alleged personal injury or damage and shall pay any damage costs and expenses including attorneys' fees, in connection with or resulting from such suit or action. Seller agrees that it and its subcontractors will maintain public liability and property damage insurance in reasonable amounts covering the above obligation and will maintain workers' compensation coverage covering all employees performing this order on premises occupied by or under the control of APS.
- 9. PATENT AND COPYRIGHT INDEMNITY.** Seller shall pay all royalty and license fees relating to deliverables and other items covered hereby. In the event any third party shall claim that the reproduction, manufacture, use or sale of goods or items covered hereby infringes any copyright, trademark, patent, or other intellectual property rights, Seller shall indemnify and hold APS harmless from any cost, expense, damage, or loss resulting therefrom.
- 10. DISCOUNTS.** APS will take advantage of prompt payment discounts whenever possible; however these will not be used as a means to determine the low responsive and responsible bidder. Any discount period will not begin until the materials, supplies or services have been received and accepted and a correct invoice submitted for payment. If testing is required, discount period will not begin until such tests are satisfactorily completed.
- 11. CONTINGENCY FEES.** Seller warrants that no person or selling agency has been employed or retained to solicit or secure this order upon an agreement or understanding for a commission, percentage, brokerage or contingent fee excepting bona-fide employees or bona-fide established commercial or selling agencies maintained or utilized by Seller for the purpose of securing business. For violation or breach of this warranty, APS shall have the right to annul this order without liability or, at its discretion, to deduct from this order, price or consideration or otherwise recover the full amount of such commission, percentage, brokerage or contingent fee.
- 12. PENALTIES.** The New Mexico Procurement Code (NMSA 1978) imposes civil and criminal penalties for its violation. In addition, New Mexico criminal statutes impose penalties for bribes, gratuities and kickbacks.
- 13. TITLE AND DELIVERY.** Title to the materials and supplies passed hereunder shall pass to APS at the F.O.B. point specified subject to the right of APS to reject upon inspection. For any exception to the delivery date specified, Seller shall give prior notification and obtain approval thereto from APS's Purchasing Department. Order is subject to termination for failure to make timely delivery.
- 14. TAX STATUS.** APS holds a Class 9 Nontaxable Transaction Certificate and is exempt from payment of tax on the purchase of tangible personal property. This certificate will be issued upon request. It is not valid for the purchase of services including construction, or materials that become part of a construction project or for the lease of property. Seller is responsible for payment of all applicable taxes, which will be added to invoice as a separate item at the current rate.
- 15. APPLICABLE LAWS.** If this order is a subcontract under a U.S. Government Prime Contract, applicable clauses of the Federal Acquisition Regulations are incorporated herein by reference. Any provision required to be included in a contract of this type by any applicable and valid Executive Order, federal, state or local law, ordinance, rule or regulation also shall be deemed to be incorporated herein. Any contract or litigation resulting from acceptance of this purchase order will be construed according to the laws of the State of New Mexico unless otherwise stated.

# SUBMISSION COVER SHEET

(Submit with your bid.)



**BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT:** By responding to this Bid, the undersigned Bidder (1) acknowledges that he or she agrees to the terms and conditions set forth in this Bid; (2) certifies that the Bidder has not, either directly or indirectly, entered into action in restraint of full competition in connection with the bid submitted to the District; and (3) agrees to furnish the materials, supplies or services as required within the time specified under the conditions imposed at the price indicated.

Signature of Authorized Representative: *Christy Griffith* Contractor's License #: *N/A*  
(If Applicable)

Type or print name of above: *Christy Griffith* Address 1: *7858 Industrial Pkwy*

Name of Firm: *Junior Library Guild* Address 2: *Plain City, OH 43064*

Telephone No.: *800-743-4070* E-Mail: *jlg bids@juniorlibraryguild.com*

Resident/Veterans Preference Certification No. (If applicable): *N/A*

**Contact information for Sales Department:**

**Contact information for POs/Invoicing/Etc.:**

Name of Contact: *Barb Sanders*

Name of Contact: *Angie Sargent*

Telephone No.: *800-491-0174*

Telephone No.: *800-743-4070*

Email Address: *sales@juniorlibraryguild.com*

Email Address: *Member service@juniorlibraryguild.com*

\*\*\* IF ANY OF THIS CONTACT INFORMATION CHANGES, IT IS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE CONTRACTOR TO IMMEDIATELY NOTIFY APS PROCUREMENT. \*\*\*

## BID SUBMITTAL REQUIREMENTS AND CHECKLIST

Please submit your completed bid, including the following items. Note that the requested information is mandatory and failure to submit these items with your response may deem it non-responsive and may be disqualified. Submittals must be in the following order and all items must be included in your response to this bid.

**PRINTED SUBMITTALS:**

- Submission Cover Sheet **SIGNED**
- Bid Pricing List – **DO NOT SUBMIT ANY PRINTED CATALOGS.**
- Specification Exception Form **SIGNED**
- Completed Conflict of Interest and Debarment/Suspension Form (see Compliance section) **SIGNED**
- Campaign Contributions Disclosure Form (see Compliance section) **SIGNED**
- Resident Contractor (or Veteran Resident Contractor) Preference Certificate **SIGNED**
- Addendums (if applicable) – before submitting your bid, please check for addendums here:  
<http://www.aps.edu/procurement/current-bids-and-rfps>

**ELECTRONIC SUBMITTALS:**

- Electronic Price List/Catalog (either include a web-link where your pricing lists/catalogs can be found (in the space provided on the Bid Pricing List) or include a CD with your pricing list/catalogs)
- Electronic Version of Bid Pricing List – please find an excel spreadsheet on the APS Procurement website here: <https://www.aps.edu/procurement/current-bids-and-rfps> Fill in all **highlighted** fields in the spreadsheet.

## Bid Pricing List

(Submit with your bid.)

Description	% off of publishers' price
Paperback Books – English	10 - 50%
Paperback Books – Spanish	No Bid
Paperback Books – Other Languages	No Bid
Hardcover Books – English	10 - 75%
Hardcover Books – English – Trade Books	10 - 75%
Hardcover Books – English – Publishers Reinforced Library Binding	10 - 75%
Hardcover Books – English – Pre-Bound	No Bid
Hardcover Books – Spanish	10 - 75%
Hardcover Books – Spanish – Publishers Reinforced Library Binding	10 - 75%
Hardcover Books – Other Languages*	No Bid
Hardcover Books – Other Languages* – Publishers Reinforced Library Binding	No Bid
<b>Other: Binding Service</b>	No Bid % discount

\*Other Languages: Vietnamese, Navajo, Zuni, Chinese (Mandarin or Cantonese), Farsi, Arabic, Swahili, and others as needs are identified.

A. Exclusions (if any): \_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

B. Turn-around time after receipt of order: 15-30 days or as scheduled

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

C. Please specify library processing capabilities (if any) to include labeling, barcodes, electronic files (MARC records, etc.), tattle-tape strips, genre stickers, etc. Please also list the cost for these items if available:

Junior Library Guild offers shelf ready or a la carte processing. Please see attached price schedule

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

D. Please specify replacement policies: Any item that is damaged, defective or has incorrect processing will be promptly replaced at no cost to the district.

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

E. Please specify shipping costs & policies: Shipping is free. We ship via USPS or UPS based on best price available. If desired, district may specify shipping method at no additional charge.

\_\_\_\_\_

\_\_\_\_\_

Pricing may be found at [www.juniorlibraryguild.com](http://www.juniorlibraryguild.com)

## Junior Library Guild Price Schedule Books

Junior Library Guild books are priced at flat rates depending on the age and type of title regardless of the publisher's original price. The discount ranges from 20-75% for hardbound titles and 20-50% for paperback titles.

**JLG Categories/New-Release Books**—Each standard JLG Category contains 12 hardbound, new-release books and are priced between \$177.60 and \$207.60 (\$14.80 to \$17.30 per book). These prices reflect a discount of up to 50% off the publisher's price. Please see attached breakdown of levels by price.

**JLG Plus Categories/New-Release Books**—Each JLG Plus Category contains 14 hardbound, new-release books and are priced between \$207.20 and \$242.20 (\$14.80 to 17.30 per book).

**JLG Paperbacks High School**—This Category contains 12 new-release, direct to trade paperback titles and is priced at \$117.60, just \$9.50 per book. Our price reflects a discount of up to 50% off the publisher's price.

**School Library Journal Series Nonfiction Categories**—These 9 Categories are the fruit of the collaboration between JLG and our sister company *School Library Journal* (SLJ) and contain the best books in the best nonfiction series as chosen by the editors of SLJ in the following categories:

- Science Grades K-2
- Science Grades 3-5
- Science Grades 6-8
- Social Studies Grades K-2
- Social Studies Grades 3-5
- Social Studies Grades 6-8
- History Grades 3-5
- History Grades 6-8
- How-To Grades 3-5

Each SLJ Category contains 12 hardbound nonfiction titles and is priced at \$243.00, just \$20.25 per book. Our price reflects a discount of up to 40% off the publisher's price.

**Audiobooks**—Each JLG Audiobooks Category contains 6 titles, shipped bimonthly, and is priced at \$258.00, just \$43.00 per title. Our price reflects a discount of up to 40% off the publisher's price.

**JLG Selections**—Previous JLG releases are available for purchase and are priced at \$12.00, \$9.00, \$5.00 and \$3.00 with monthly specials priced at \$7.00.

This pricing reflects a discount of up to 75% off the publisher's price. Pricing for individual JLG Selections may be found at [www.juniorlibraryguild.com](http://www.juniorlibraryguild.com).

**Bindings Guarantee**—Junior Library Guild purchases the best bindings available in the publisher's first edition. Many of these are library bound with the remainder being trade reinforced (excluding our paperback level). Junior Library Guild has a 100% guarantee on all of our bindings: if they, at any time, do not live up to your expectations, we will replace the book, no questions asked.

## Processing

Shelf Ready Processing— Includes customized MARC record, attached Mylar jacket, barcode and spine label.....	\$2.00/ book
MARC Records— Standard.....	FREE
Customized.....	\$36.00/year
Mylar Jackets.....	\$1.25/ book
Catalog Card Kits— Includes self-adhesive book pocket, label set (1 for book pocket, 1 for spine), check out card, catalog card set (1 main entry, 2 shelf list cards, subject card, and added entry cards).....	\$1.00/ book
Shelf List Card.....	\$0.50/ book
Barcodes— Requires customized MARC records (Unattached).....	\$0.60/ book
Spine Labels (Unattached).....	Free with Customized MARC Records .....OR \$0.50/ book
Magnetic Theft Detection Strip (Unattached). ....	\$0.50/ book