



Accelerate Progress for Students

Charlotte Gensler
Executive Director

Scott Elder
Superintendent

DATE: 3/12/2024

BID NUMBER: 24-055AF

BID TITLE: Plastic Can Liners for Warehouse Stock

ADDENDUM NUMBER: 1

See Attached Questions and Answers

Question 1:

Please provide bid tabulations and itemized award report, including any price adjustments

- a. If no previous bid is available, please provide you most recent vendor(s) & unit prices for each line item.

Response:

You can request bid tabulation information as a Public Records Request at the following link:

<https://aps.nextrequest.com/>

Question 2:

Does the warehouse have a loading dock and/or forklift?

Response:

Yes, the warehouse has both a loading dock and forklift

Question 3:

Approximately how often are orders placed and in what quantities?

Response:

Usually twice yearly depending on the school usage. In quantities of 2400 cases



6.15.2020

Question 4:

Please provide the address and contact information where samples should be sent prior to bid opening.

Response:

Please send samples to:

Mary Grace Madrid, Manager
APS Materials Management Warehouse Facility
912 Oak St SE
Albuquerque, NM 87106
505-848-8842 ext. 67282

Question 5:

Can you provide the award pricing per item and winning vendor from the previous bid?

Response:

See attached

Question 6:

Can you also provide the pricing that the awarded vendor put for subsequent years?

Response:

See attached

Question 7:

Can we call FedEx at our expense to pick up a sample of each plastic can liner you are currently using? If yes, can you provide us with the address where FedEx should go, a contact name, phone number & email address, and the times FedEx can come?

Response:

No, the warehouse is not set up for purchasing or sending out single stock. They would only be able to send out a case, which would compromise their inventory.

Question 8:

Based on previous ordering history and purchase orders, about how often are the Plastic Can Liners ordered (monthly, quarterly or other) and what is an approximate case order?



Response:

See question 3

Question 9:

What is the case weight (lbs. per case) currently being purchased for items 1-4?

Response:

Item 1 Stock # 10489 weight is 16.2 lbs

Item 2 Stock #10490 weight is approx. 6.5 lbs

Item 3 Stock #10491 weight is 5.76 lbs

Item 4 Stock # 10742 weight is 6.28 lbs

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM WITH SUBMITTED PROPOSAL:

Addenda not signed and returned may consider the RFP non-responsive and may be rejected.

COMPANY/FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

DATE



6.15.2020

Bid 18-038AM
Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

| 1. CASE | TRASH BAGS, SMALL - Stock #10489 | | | | | |
|--|----------------------------------|-----------------------|--------------|------------|-----------------------|----------------------------------|
| Plastic bags (Natural) 24" x 33", 12-16 gallon capacity. No less than 8 Migrants, and .31 mil. 50 bags/roll, 20 rolls/case. To be as Interplast #S243308N or equal. ***SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED*** | | | | | | |
| | Vendor | Equal | As Specified | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | MM1/Stock Control Recommendation |
| | Standard Restaurant Supply | Interplast #EC243308N | ✓ | \$ 11.60 | | Recommend Award - As Specified |
| | Interboro Packaging Corp | | | \$ 12.98 | | |
| | Central Poly Corp | | | \$ 13.40 | | |
| | Unipak | | | \$ 16.75 | | |
| | Brady Industries | | | \$ 18.85 | | |
| | * Veritiv | | | \$ 19.99 | \$ 18.991 | |
| | * Coppola Supply Inc. | | | \$ 21.84 | \$ 19.656 | |
| | * LD Supply | | | \$ 21.62 | \$ 20.539 | |
| | Sysco New Mexico | | | \$ 20.28 | | |
| | Staples Business | | | \$ 21.89 | | |
| | Sandia Office Supply | | | \$ 23.30 | \$ 22.140 | |
| | All American Poly | | | \$ 25.24 | | |
| | School Specialty | | | \$ 27.76 | | |
| | * Western Paper | | | BLANK | | |

Bid 18-038AM
Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

| 2. | CASE | TRASH BAGS, LARGE - STOCK #10490 | | | | | |
|----|------|--|-----------------------------|--------------|------------|-----------------------|--|
| | | Low Density Plastic Bag with Star Bottom Seal. SIZE: 36" x 47" (slightly different size will be considered) CAPACITY: 40 - 45 GALLON STRENGTH: Heavy Duty GUAGE: No less than .68 Mil COLOR: Black or White or Clear PACKAGING: Flat Pack QUANTITY: 200 -225 PER CASE OR 220 - 240 PER CASE. Coreless, interleaved rolls. To be as Berry Plastics LSR3646XW or equal. ***SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED*** | | | | | |
| | | Vendor | Equal | As Specified | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | MML/Stock Control Recommendation |
| | | Central Poly Corp | Interplast #CP3647XW | | \$ 16.90 | | NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT EQUAL SIX STEP TEST 1. Test One - Stretch bag at top: Bag tore easily without using much force. 2. Test Two - Side Seam: N/A 3. Test Three - Strength and Resistance: Poked fingers through bag and bag tore easily without using much force. Bag weak and not durable 4. Test Four - Strength and Resistance: Grabbed bag around hole made by fingers. Bag tore easily like a zipper. Bag weak and not durable 5. Test Five - Strength and Resistance: Made a fist and easily poked hole without using much force. Bag weak and not durable 6. Test Six - Air Pressure: Filled bag with air and pressed against wall. Bag did not stretch and immediately sustained a hole. Bag weak and not durable. |
| | * | Coppola Supply Inc. | Pinnacle Plastics L4046.68W | | \$ 19.70 | \$ 17.730 | NOT AS SPECIFIED NOT EQUAL SIX STEP TEST 1. Test One - Stretch bag at top: Bag tore easily without using much force. 2. Test Two - Side Seam: N/A 3. Test Three - Strength and Resistance: Poked fingers through bag and bag tore easily without using much force. Bag weak and not durable 4. Test Four - Strength and Resistance: Grabbed bag around hole made by fingers. Bag tore easily like a zipper. Bag weak and not durable 5. Test Five - Strength and Resistance: Made a fist and easily poked hole without using much force. Bag weak and not durable 6. Test Six - Air Pressure: Filled bag with air and pressed against wall. Bag did not stretch and immediately sustained a hole. Bag weak and not durable. |
| | * | Veritiv | Berry Plastics LSR3646XW | ✓ | \$ 19.03 | \$ 18.079 | RECOMMEND AWARD - As Specified SIX STEP TEST 1. Test One - Stretch bag at top: When bag is held at the top and stretched it did not tear 2. Test Two - Side Seam: N/A 3. Test Three - Strength and Resistance: Applied excessive force to poke fingers through bag 4. Test Four - Strength and Resistance: Grabbed bag around hole made by fingers. Bag stayed intact and did not tear 5. Test Five - Strength and Resistance: Applied excessive force to poke fist through bag. Bag is resilient and durable 6. Test Six - Air Pressure: Filled bag with air and pressed against wall. Bag stretched double in size and after multiple attempts the bag finally sustained a hole around the area that stretched from multiple attempts |
| | | Brady Industries | | | \$ 17.75 | | |
| | | Interboro Packaging Corp | | | \$ 17.84 | | |
| | | Unipak | | | \$ 18.50 | | |
| | | Sysco New Mexico | | | \$ 18.55 | | |
| | * | LD Supply | | | \$ 20.80 | \$ 19.760 | |
| | | Standard Restaurant | | | \$ 19.47 | | |
| | | Sandla Office Supply | | | \$ 21.30 | \$ 20.240 | |
| | | School Specialty | | | \$ 23.18 | | |
| | | All American Poly | | | \$ 24.34 | | |
| | | Staples Business Advantage | | | \$ 25.32 | | |
| | * | Western Paper | | | BLANK | | |

Bid 18-038AM
Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

| 3 | CASE | BAGS FOR SANI-NAPKIN RECEPTACLE - STOCK #10491 | | | | | |
|---|------|--|-------|--------------|------------|-----------------------|---|
| | | Plastic liners for sanitary napkin dispenser, 17" x 17". 1000 Bags/Case. To be as Republic Bag Co #RCI-17-040 or equal. ***SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED*** | | | | | |
| | | Vendor | Equal | As Specified | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | MM1/Stock Control Recommendation |
| | | Sysco New Mexico Sysco/Classic #H3417RC5 | Y | | \$ 6.87 | | Recommend Award - Equal to As Specified |
| | | Interboro Packaging Corp INT-1717-R | | | \$ 7.62 | | |
| | * | Coppola Supply Inc. Napco #C-1811 | | | \$ 9.38 | \$ 8.442 | |
| | | Staples Business Advantage Heritage #403704 | | | \$ 8.59 | | |
| | | Sandla Office Supply H3417RC | | | \$ 9.15 | \$ 8.690 | |
| | * | Veritiv Berry Plastic LBR17176C | | | \$ 9.65 | \$ 9.168 | |
| | * | LD Supply | | | \$ 10.26 | \$ 9.747 | |
| | | Central Poly Corp | | | \$ 13.80 | | |
| | | Brady Industries | | | \$ 15.36 | | |
| | | School Specialty | | | \$ 15.88 | | |
| | | All American Poly | | | \$ 16.19 | | |
| | | Standard Restaurant Supply | | | \$ 16.85 | | |
| | * | Western Paper | | | BLANK | | |
| | | Unipak | | | NB | | |

Bid 18-038AM
Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

| | | | | | | |
|---|------|--|--------------|---------------------|-------------------|---|
| 4 | CASE | PLASTIC BAGS 5 x 4.5 x 5 x 15 - STOCK #10742 | | | | |
| | | Non-vented 5" x 4 1/2" x 15" Linear Low Density Poly Gusset Bags. .75 Mil. 0.00075 guage. Must be in DISPENSER packs of 100 for sterility, cleanliness and convenience. Ideal for ice packs etc. 10 dispenser packs/100 bags/box. Total 1000 bags/box. To be as TUF #7G054515 or equal. ***SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED*** | | | | |
| | | Vendor | Equal | As Specified | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price |
| | | MM1/Stock Control Recommendation | | | | |
| | | Sysco New Mexico | ✓ | | \$ 10.12 | |
| | | Heritage #F0915RC | | | | Recommend Award - Equal to as Specified |
| | | Sandia Office Supply | | | \$ 11.60 | \$ 11.020 |
| | | Heritage #F0915RC | | | | |
| | | Staples Business Advantage | | | \$ 11.78 | |
| | | Heritage #888948 | | | | |
| | | Central Poly Corp | | | \$ 11.80 | |
| | | Inteplast #PB054515 | | | | |
| | * | Veritiv | | | \$ 15.50 | \$ 14.725 |
| | | TUF #7G054515 | | | | |
| | * | Coppola Supply Inc. | | | \$ 16.80 | \$ 15.120 |
| | | Interboro Packaging Corp | | | \$ 15.32 | |
| | | Standard Restaurant Supply | | | \$ 15.36 | |
| | * | Western Paper | | | BLANK | |
| | | All American Poly | | | N/B | |
| | | Brady Industries | | | N/B | |
| | * | LD Supply | | | N/B | |
| | | School Specialty | | | NB | |
| | | Unipak | | | NB | |

BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Number: 18-038 AM

DESCRIPTION: Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

BUYER: Abigail Manzanares

Requesting Department: M M 1

Item 1 TRASH BAGS SMALL - STOCK #10489
 Plastic bags (Natural) 24" x 33", 12-16 gallon capacity. No less than 8 Migrants, and .31 mil. 50 bags/roll, 20 rolls/case.
 To be as Interplast #S243308N or equal. SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED

| Vendor | Equal | Unit Price | Preference | Requesting Department Recommendation |
|----------------------------|-------|------------|------------|--|
| Standard Restaurant Supply | | \$ 11.60 | | Recommend Award - As Specified Interplast #ec243308N |
| Interboro Packaging Corp | | \$ 12.98 | | |
| Central Poly Corp | | \$ 13.40 | | |
| Unipak | | \$ 16.75 | | |
| Brady Industries | | \$ 18.85 | | |
| Veritiv | | \$ 19.99 | 18.991 | |
| Coppola Supply Inc | | \$ 21.84 | 19.656 | |
| LD Supply | | \$ 21.62 | 20.539 | |
| Sysco New Mexico | | \$ 20.28 | | |
| Staples Business | | \$ 21.89 | | |
| Sandia Office Supply | | \$ 23.30 | 22.14 | |
| All American Poly | | \$ 25.24 | | |
| School Specialty | | \$ 27.76 | | |
| Western Paper | | BLANK | | |

BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Number: 18-027 R A

DESCRIPTION: Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

BUYER: Abigail Manzanares

Requesting Department: M M 1

Item 2 TRASH BAGS, LARGE - STOCK #10490

Item Description Low Density Plastic Bag with Star Bottom Seal. SIZE: 36" x 47" (slightly different size will be considered) CAPACITY: 40 - 45 GALLON
 STRENGTH: Heavy Duty GUAGE: No less than .58 Mil COLOR: Black or White or Clear PACKAGING: Flat Pack QUANTITY:
 200 -225 PER CASE OR 220 - 240 PER CASE. Coreless, interleaved rolls. To be as Berry Plastics LSR3646XW or equal.
 SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED.

| Vendor | Equal | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | Requesting Department Recommendation |
|--------------------------|-------|------------|-----------------------|---|
| Central Poly Copy | \$ | 16.90 | | NOT AS SPECIFIED- NOT EQUAL |
| Coppola Supply | \$ | 19.70 | \$ 17.730 | Interplast#CP3647XW NOT AS SPECIFIED- NOT EQUAL Pinnacle Plastics L4046.68W |
| Veritiv | \$ | 19.03 | \$ 18.079 | RECOMMEND AWARD AS SPECIFIED Berry Plastics LSR3646XW |
| Brady Industries | \$ | 17.75 | | |
| Interbora Packaging Corp | \$ | 17.84 | | |
| Unipak | \$ | 18.50 | | |
| Sysco New Mexico | \$ | 18.55 | | |
| LD Supply | \$ | 20.80 | \$ 19.760 | |
| Standard Resturant | \$ | 19.47 | | |
| Sandia Office Supply | \$ | 21.30 | \$ 20.240 | |
| School Specialty | \$ | 23.18 | | |
| All American Poly | \$ | 24.34 | | |

Staples Business Advantage \$ 25.32
 Western Paper BLANK

BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Number: 18-027 R A

DESCRIPTION: Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

BUYER: Abigail Manzanares

Requesting Department: M M 1

Item 3 BAGS FOR SANI-NAPKIN RECEPTACLE - STOCK #10491

Item Description Plastic liners for sanitary napkin dispenser, 17" x 17". 1000 Bags/Case. To be as Republic Bag Co #RCI-17-040 or equal.
SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED.

| Vendor | Equal | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | Requesting Department Recommendation |
|----------------------------|-------|------------|-----------------------|--|
| Sysco New Mexico | | \$ 6.87 | | Recommmend Award - Equal to As Specified |
| Interboro Packaging Corp | | \$ 7.62 | | Sysco Classic #H34117RCS |
| Coppola Supply Inc. | | \$ 9.38 | \$ 8.442 | INT-1717-R Napco #C-1811 |
| Staples Business Advantage | | \$ 8.59 | | Heritage #403704 |
| Sandia Office Supply | | \$ 9.15 | \$ 8.690 | H3417RC |
| Vertiv | | \$ 9.65 | \$ 9.168 | Berry Plaxtic LBR17176C |
| LD Supply | | \$ 10.26 | \$ 9.747 | |
| Central Poly Corp | | \$ 13.80 | | |
| Brady Industries | | \$ 15.36 | | |
| School Specialty | | \$ 15.88 | | |
| All American Poly | | \$ 16.19 | | |
| Standard Restaurant Supply | | \$ 16.85 | | |
| Western Paper | | BLANK | | |
| Unipak | | NO BID | | |

BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Number: 18-027 R A

DESCRIPTION: Plastic Can Liners for APS Warehouse

BUYER: Abigail Manzanares

Requesting Department: M M 1

Item 4 PLASTIC BAGS 5x4.5x5x15 - STOCK #10742
 Item Description Non-vented 5" x 4 1/2" x 15" Linear Low Density Poly Gusset Bags . 75 Mil. 0.00075 guage. Must be in DISPENSER packs of 100 for sterility, cleanliness and convenience. Ideal for ice packs etc. 10 dispenser packs/100 bags/box. Total 1000 bags/box. To be as TUF #7G054515 or equal. SAMPLE REQUIRED EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED

| Vendor | Equal | Unit Price | Preference Unit Price | Requesting Department Recommendation |
|----------------------------|--------|------------|-----------------------|--|
| Sysco New Mexico | \$ | 10.12 | | Recommend Award- Equal to as Specified |
| Sandia Office Supply | \$ | 11.60 | \$ 11.020 | Heritage #F0915RC Heritage #F0915RC |
| Staples Business Advantage | \$ | 11.78 | | Heritage #888948 |
| Central Poly Corp | \$ | 11.80 | | Interplast #PB054515 |
| Vertiv | \$ | 15.50 | \$ 14.725 | TUF#7G054515 |
| Coppola Supply Inc. | \$ | 16.80 | \$ 15.120 | |
| Interboro Packaging Corp | \$ | 15.32 | | |
| Standard Restaurant Supply | \$ | 15.36 | | |
| Western Paper | BLANK | | | |
| All American Poly | NO BID | | | |
| Brady Industries | NO BID | | | |
| LD Supply | NO BID | | | |
| School Speciality | NO BID | | | |
| Unipak | NO BID | | | |