



Charlotte Gensler, CPO
Executive Director: Procurement and Accounts Payable

Dr. Gabriella Durán Blakey
Superintendent

DATE: 11/08/2024

RFP NUMBER: 25-023 DNS

RFP TITLE: Grass Seed, Fertilizer and Ice Melt

ADDENDUM NUMBER: 1

1. Q: On the Football & Playground section, do they want 2000 lbs. of this mix, or 2000 lbs. of each variety in the mix. The Percentages listed throw me off a bit.

A: 2000 lbs. of mix total. Not each variety.
The set mixtures are the successful mixes for New Mexico's changing climates.
This is the combination and percentage of different seed types to make up the total mixture of the APS mix.

2. Q: If we have an item to substitute, do we hand write it on the bid form and add a tech/ submittal sheet with the bid package when we submit? Or is there a different way you would like us to note substitutes?

A: Write substitute items in next to the line item in which you are proposing a substitute, submit substitution specifications with your proposal.

3. Q: On the items listed in different categories, are you looking for a price on each individual item, or are bidders allowed to just bid on what they have/ or can get? For example, if I am a grower of Cody Buffalo grass, but I don't have the other 2 varieties, am I able to just submit a bid for the Cody, or do you expect to get pricing on everything from a single vendor? I guess my question is "Can I pick and choose on what I want to bid on?"

A: Bid on the items that you are able to supply.

4. Q: Is this something you have went out for bid for in the past? If so can I get last years bid tabs please?

A: See Attached Bid Tabulation Documents

ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM WITH SUBMITTED PROPOSAL:

Addenda not signed and returned may consider the RFP non-responsive and may be rejected.

COMPANY/FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

DATE



8.23.2022

Bid# 19-051DD Grass Seed, Fertilizer and Ice Melt

Vendor	Bamert Seed Company	Desert Mountain Corp	Ewing Irrigation
Item			
Buffalo Grass Blend			
Timeless	\$12.00	No Bid	No Bid
Cody	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bowie	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kentucky Bluegrass			
Common	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Denim	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Midnight	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Skye	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Rye Grass			
Quickstart Blend	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cabo	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kokomo	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brightstar II	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Turf Type Tall Fescue			
Genesis	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Matador	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Zanzibar	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mow-less Blend	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Triathlawn Blend	No Bid		No Bid
Sports/Park Blend			
Zanzibar, Tall Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.13
Midnight, Kentucky Bluegrass	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.13
Cabo, Perennial Rye grass	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.13
Football & Playground Blend			
Creeping Red Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Perennial Rye Grass	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Triathlawn Tall Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Misc			
Creeping Red Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.685
Fertilizer			
Turf Food 16-8-8	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.00
18-24-12	No Bid	No Bid	\$19.29
Ice Melt	No Bid	\$10.76	\$8.59

Bid# 19-064DD Grass Seed and Fertilizer Supplemental

Vendor	Central Garden and Pet	Ewing Irrigation	SiteOne Landscaping Supply	Winfield United
Item				
Buffalo Grass Blend				
Timeless	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.27	No Bid
Cody	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.27	No Bid
Bowie	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kentucky Bluegrass				
Common	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.18	\$2.66
Denim	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Midnight	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.48
Skye	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.65
Rye Grass				
Quickstart Blend	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.33	\$1.435
Cabo	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.32	\$1.26
Kokomo	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.16
Brightstar II	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.16
Turf Type Tall Fescue				
Genesis	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.45	\$1.42
Matador	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.57	\$1.615
Zanzibar	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mow-less Blend	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.25
Triathlawn Blend	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.16
Sports/Park Blend				
Zanzibar, Tall Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.58	\$1.65
Midnight, Kentucky Bluegrass	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.40
Cabo, Perennial Rye grass	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.50
Football & Playground Blend				
Creeping Red Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.68	\$1.97
Perennial Rye Grass	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.34
Triathlawn Tall Fescue	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.54
Misc				
Creeping Red Fescue	No Bid	\$1.685	\$1.70	\$1.95
Fertilizer				
Turf Food 16-8-8	No Bid	\$15.00	No Bid	\$16.20
18-24-12	\$22.00	\$18.83	\$27.490	\$17.65